
Life of Surrender 

 

Complete Surrender The concept of complete surrender is foundational in the Christian 
faith. It’s about yielding every aspect of our lives to Jesus Christ. As Romans 12:1 (NIV) 
says, “Therefore, I urge you, brothers and sisters, in view of God’s mercy, to offer your 
bodies as a living sacrifice, holy and pleasing to God—this is your true and proper 
worship.” 

The Necessity of Surrender is not just necessary; it’s the essence of Christian 
discipleship. Like the natural world submits to God’s design, we too must surrender to 
His divine will. James 4:7 (NIV) instructs us, “Submit yourselves, then, to God. Resist the 
devil, and he will flee from you.” 

The Process of Surrender is a journey we undertake with God. It’s an ongoing act of 
faith where we trust in His guidance. Proverbs 3:5-6 (NIV) encourages us, “Trust in the 
Lord with all your heart and lean not on your own understanding; in all your ways submit 
to him, and he will make your paths straight.” 

The Assurance of Surrender Even when surrender feels daunting, we can be assured 
that God is our steadfast partner. Philippians 4:13 (NIV) reminds us, “I can do all this 
through him who gives me strength.” 

The Outcome of Surrender fully surrendering to God unlocks incredible potential for 
spiritual growth and service. Ephesians 3:20 (NIV) declares, “Now to him who is able to 
do immeasurably more than all we ask or imagine, according to his power that is at 
work within us.” 

The Maintenance of Surrender Maintaining a surrendered life requires daily 
commitment and trust in God’s sustaining grace. Lamentations 3:22-23 (NIV) comforts 
us with these words, “Because of the Lord’s great love we are not consumed, for his 
compassions never fail. They are new every morning; great is your faithfulness.” 

The Blessings of Surrender A life surrendered to God is ready to be filled with His 
blessings and purposes. Matthew 5:6 (NIV) promises, “Blessed are those who hunger 
and thirst for righteousness, for they will be filled.” 
 


